
 

 
 
 
DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE: 
January 10, 2018  Miscellaneous Ala Carte Snacks and 

Beverages for Direct Delivery to School 
Cafeterias, Bid #180602 

 
DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE: 

 
An annual purchasing agreement, with a one (1) year renewal option, to provide direct delivery of 
miscellaneous ala carte snacks and beverages to school cafeterias throughout the District to be 
served as breakfast and lunch options and for ala carte sales.  Eight (8) items were bid and five (5) 
items are awarded.  Three (3) items were not awarded due to no bids being received or sample 
products not being approved in taste tests.  Items will be purchased as needed to meet breakfast and 
lunch menu requirements.  Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.  
 
Effective Dates:  February 21, 2018 through January 31, 2019.  (Initial Term) 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

  
REQUESTED BY: 

 
      Food Services 
 
    
SUPPLIER NAME:       
  
 Butler Foods of Pensacola, Cantonment, FL          
 
    
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE:  FUNDING SOURCE: 

 
$233,924.75 Est. / Yr. Food Services Fund (4110) 
 

  
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT: 

 
ECSD Bid       Bids Received:  3       
      

  
DATE AND TIME POSTED: 

 
January 10, 2018, 5:15pm Central Time 

 
 
9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years 

 
THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
75 North Pace Boulevard  

Pensacola, FL  32505 
 

BID AWARD NOTICE 
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DATE:  January 9, 2018
BID NBR:  180602
BID TITLE: MISC. ALA CARTE SNACKS AND BEVERAGES FOR DIRECT DELIVERY TO SCHOOL CAFETERIAS

Where two prices are shown, the top price is the portion price. The bottom price is the bid case/pack size. 

ITEM

Quantity: 18,000 cs 625 cs 300 cs 800 cs
New Item # New Item # New Item # New Item #

ITEM NUMBER 1 2 3 4-DELETE
Butler Foods of Pensacola 0.1955 0.6361 0.2674
Cantonment, FL 8.60 sa 15.27 25.67 No Bid
Butler Foods of Pensacola 0.2625 o
Cantonment, FL 11.55 sa NA NA NA
Cool Tropics ay
Bedford, MA No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.28125 mu
Harvest Hill Beverage Co. 0.1375 m
Stamford, CT 5.5000 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Awarded Items are highlighted

100% Fruit
Tea

Variety Flavors
Fries

Baked

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505

BID TABULATION

100% Fruit Juice Fruit Strips
Shelf Stable 4oz
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ITEM

Quantity: 1,400 cs 130 cs 150 cs 200 cs
New Item # 0513080 New Item # New Item #

ITEM NUMBER 5 6 7-DELETE 8-DELETE
Butler Foods of Pensacola 0.2850 ny 0.4208 au 0.9094 r
Cantonment, FL 34.20 20.20 ss No Bid 43.65 nu
Butler Foods of Pensacola 0.3583 ny 0.4667
Cantonment, FL 43.00 28.00 NA NA
Cool Tropics
Bedford, MA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harvest Hill Beverage Co.
Stamford, CT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

NA= Not Applicable
a = Alternate bid 
y =Product was approved in taste test
m=Minimum order quantity
mu=Minimum order quantity unacceptable
n= No prior approved brand
nu=New item was not approved in taste test
ny=New item was approved in taste test
o=Pricing for orange flavor only
r=Refrigerated product
sa=Split award quantity for item #1 - 20% of 18,000 at $11.25; 80% of 18,000 at $8.60 
ss=Shelf stable product was not approved 

Individual
HummusCookie Pudding Cup Pita Chips

Soft Baked Frozen Individual
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BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: 
http://ecsd-fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids. Notices will not be automatically.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law within the time allowed 
for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida Statutes. 

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department
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